
 

Five new jobs for humans if robots take over
the world
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By now you've probably heard how robots are going to take over our
jobs. And how this will leave future generations with plenty of time on
their hands to take up hobbies and pursue creative interests. All while
our robot friends spend their days doing the lion's share of the work
needed to make the world run.
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A lot of this is indeed true, robots probably will take over a significant
share of labour in some industries – meaning that not too far in the
distant future your waiter, taxi driver or even the person on the other end
of the phone trying to sell you something could well be a robot.

But while robots taking over our jobs could be a cause of concern for
people in these professions, the fact of the matter is that the growth of
the robotics industry will also help to revitalise the job market – helping
to create numerous new roles and positions that haven't even been
invented yet.

As a researcher, I am especially interested in the consumer robots
market, which is expected to be worth US$33 billion by 2025. My
current job – pre-robot takeover – is to understand the relationship
between humans and robots and its implications on consumption. This
basically means my research explores the acceptance and potential
rapport humans (may) develop with so-called "social robots" – these are
the ones that interact and communicate directly with humans.

I also look at how these relationships affect various markets and the new
business avenues and jobs that will be created. The bottom line is that
the future job market will not be without challenges, but as so often in
history, humans will adapt and make use of the new opportunities. And
here are five new jobs that will (probably) be created for humans when
robots take over the world.

1. Robot singing teacher

There will be companies focused on the development of software and
applications for robots that go well beyond the standard factory
functions. This may include add-on singing and dance functions, or
language functions, or cooking functions – and the reality of this isn't
even that far off. Softbank's social robot Pepper – which has been a
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massive hit in the US and is already in use in the UK – can already sing
and perform various dance moves to entertain its owner.

Off the back of this need for additional functionality, there will be a new
job market created for humans to develop software and hardware which
enables these robots to reach more sophisticated performance levels.

2. Robot plastic surgeon

Of course all good robots will need to be personalised, so chances are
companies will pop up which allow people to update their personal
robots by adding stronger limbs or faster processors.

Humans already engage in many forms of physical enhancement by
exercising, using make up, or in more extreme cases, through plastic
surgery. And as humans develop stronger bonds with their social robots,
there will be an increased demand for companies that provide
customisation options to robots.

In this way Bluefrogrobotics' new social robot "Buddy" already offers
this option – it comes with the promise of continuous upgrade options to
keep the user experience as exciting and satisfying as possible.

3. Robot nurse

Just like us humans, robots will also need regular "health checks" and
periodical check-ups to make sure they are performing smoothly. Being
a robot technician is already an existing and well remunerated career
path that has benefited from a growing industry – though to date the
focus has been on the industrial arena. In the advent of the social robots
revolution there will be a need for robot "nurses" that can also provide
their services for this more mainstream market.

3/5

http://www.yellowad.co.uk/article.cfm?id=128320&headline=Southend%20Council%20becomes%20first%20in%20UK%20to%20introduce%20a%20robot%20as%20part%20of%20social%20care%20team%C2%A7ionIs=news&searchyear=2017
http://www.bluefrogrobotics.com/en/buddy/
http://insights.globalspec.com/article/4872/how-to-become-a-robotics-technician
https://phys.org/tags/social+robots/


 

4. Robot travel agents

Chances are that people will want to take their robots with them during
their travels. This is especially likely to be the case if humans have
developed a strong bond towards them – such as the children's play
buddy PLEO, who can already be found in households around the globe.

Just like humans, robots also need to be able to get around the place,
which will see companies focused on robotic transport coming into
business. This will entail creating adequate storage for the robots – such
as suitcases – as well as charging and maintenance stations outside
people's homes.

5. Organisers and judges for best (robot) in show

Research suggests that humans develop strong bonds with their pets – or
even their cars – as they serve as an extension of their self. In some
instances, these pets or cars can even become status symbols –
motivating the owners to spend considerable money on them and to
display them publicly. Scholars argue that in the near future, robots may
also become part of our "extended self" – making it likely that similar
events may be developed for the robot in our lives.

So in the same way people enter their cat or dog into a pet show, chances
are that many proud robot "owners" will also be interested in displaying
their customised robots to others to gain recognition for their designs.
This will lead to companies cropping up that focus on the organisation of
events and meetings where "owners" display their robots.

This article was originally published on The Conversation. Read the 
original article.
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