
 

Demographic change depresses tax revenues
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By 2060, income tax revenues will be between 12 and 21 percent lower than in a
scenario without demographic change, whereas sales tax revenues will be
between 13 and 25 percent lower. Credit: Fraunhofer FIT

Population aging and ultimately population shrinking in Germany will
depress tax revenues in the medium and long term, as a recent analysis
by Fraunhofer FIT and Prognos shows.

In the next decades, population aging in Germany will accelerate and
also induce a decline of the total population. These demographic changes
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can be expected to have a profound impact on the governmental budget.
While changes in public expenditures have been forecasted regularly
since 2005, the revenue side has received less attention to date. A new
study by the Fraunhofer Institute for Applied Information Technology
FIT and the Prognos AG sheds light on the impact of demographic
change on the future development of tax revenues. The study focuses on
the development of income tax revenues given a shrinking working
population, but also considers sales tax revenues, which account for a
similarly large share of total tax revenues.

Fraunhofer FIT quantifies income tax revenues in the years 2030, 2045
and 2060 using simulation models based on microeconomic data.
Starting from a scenario without any demographic changes, the study
distinguishes three possible paths for the development of the population
in Germany. These correspond to the variants 2 (continuity), 3 (relatively
old population) and 6 (relatively young population) of the official
forecast of the Federal Statistical Office.

In all scenarios, the expected demographic changes are found to have a
clear negative impact on both income and sales tax revenues. This holds
especially true for the more distant future, when the population in
Germany will not only be markedly older but also smaller than today. By
2060, income tax revenues will be between 12 and 21 percent lower than
in a scenario without demographic change, whereas sales tax revenues
will be between 13 and 25 percent lower. Population aging increases the
impact of various deductibility rules on total income tax revenues, in
particular the impact of the deductibility of old-age and health insurance
provisions. The tax code actually enhances the generosity of old-age
provision deductions until 2040, whereas the taxable share of old-age
pensions increases. The income tax balance of this "deferred taxation" is
negative and the problem is aggravated by demographic change. Due to
expected increases in real incomes, however, demographic change does
not imply an absolute drop in income and sales tax revenues in the next
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decades.

  More information: publica.fraunhofer.de/eprints/ …
e_0011-n-4176903.pdf
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