
 

Invasive species widespread, but not more
than at home range

March 1 2011

Invasive plant species have long had a reputation as being bad for a new
ecosystem when they are introduced.

Stan Harpole, assistant professor of ecology, evolution and organismal
biology at Iowa State University, is founding organizer of a team of
more than 70 researchers working at 65 sites worldwide that tested that
assumption.

They wanted to know if it is true that problematic invasive species often
spread widely in their new habitats because they don't encounter
predators or diseases that help keep them in check in their home ranges.

"There is this assumption that when plants invade a new area that they
become much more abundant in the new area than they were in the
native areas," said Harpole. "It turns out that, on average, they aren't any
more abundant away from home than they are at home."

Harpole says there is a "rule of 10s" that can apply to invasive species.

"Of, say, 100 plants that arrive in a new area, only about 10 percent of
those will survive without being in a greenhouse or some other controlled
area," said Harpole. "Of those 10 that can survive, only about 10 percent
of those really cause problems.

"When you think about all the species we've brought over from other
areas, relatively few have become serious pest species. The problem is
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we've brought over so many that quite a few have become major
problems and they get a lot of attention."

Harpole points to the kudzu plant as an example.

Kudzu was introduced from Asia as a soil erosion plant more than a
century ago. It now chokes out native species from Texas to Maine to
Florida, according to the U.S. Department of Agriculture.

Problem plants like this are uncommon when compared to all the exotic
species in a region, but they do get the most interest and may give the
impression that species that escape their home range often spread and
take over new habitats and become more abundant than before, says
Harpole.

Invasion can also be thought of more generally as a process in which new
species enter new habitats. Even plants now considered native were once
invaders, says Harpole.

When glaciers receded from the Midwest 10,000 years ago, there were
no native species in the area – the retreating ice left bare ground open
for invasion.

"All the plants that are now seen as native were invasive in the past in the
sense that they had to spread across the landscape," he said.

"What's different today is that we move plants so much faster than they
would move by themselves. Now a species can become global in a matter
of years, where it may have taken tens of thousands of years in the past,"
said Harpole.

  More information: Harpole is coauthor of a research paper led by
Jennifer Firn of Queensland University of Technology, Australia, and is
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published in the journal Ecology Letters.
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